CITY OF WATERTOWN, NEW YORK

CITY HALL

245 WASHINGTON STREET

WATERTOWN, NEW YORK 13601-3380

TURF TREATMENT CHEMICALS, FERTILIZER & SEED
Project: PRODUCTS FOR PARKS AND RECREATION
Bid / RFP Number: Bid #2025-03
Opening Date: Thursday March 20, 2025 @ 11:00AM
The following results are bids as presented at the bid opening and do not represent an award.
Harrell's, LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply Andre & Son Inc.
Description UOM $10,318.30 $20,806.26 $55,107.50
Est. Usage Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price |  Total Price

Nature Safe Fertilizer 12-0-6 Ammonium Sulfate Fortified 50 Ib. bag 91 NO BID Alternate see below $37.25 $3,389.75
Turf King Cal Plus (SGN 220) 50 Ib. bag 55 NO BID NO BID $12.35 $679.25
Turf King 25-0-4 Fertilizer w/50% XCU Slow release, 2% Iron (SGN 220) 50 Ib. bag 74 NO BID Alternate see below $21.60 $1,598.40
Turf King 28-0-15 Fertilizer w/ 90% Methylene Urea (SGN 220) 50 Ib. bag 104 NO BID NO BID $39.50 $4,108.00
Turf King 25-0-5 Fertilizer w/ 65% XCU & NutriLife (SGN 220) 50 Ib. bag 164 NO BID NO BID $22.50 $3,690.00
Precision Organics C20 Soil Builder -concentrated food source for microbes 40 Ib. bag 138 $35.00 $4,830.00 NO BID $37.00 $5,106.00
Turf King 23-0-20 Fertilizer w/ 95% Nutralene, 1% Iron (SGN 150) 50 Ib. bag 300 NO BID NO BID $44.00 $13,200.00
Turf King 19-26-5 Fertilizer w/ 30% XCU, 1% lIron (SGN 220) 50 Ib. bag 10 NO BID NO BID $43.80 $438.00
Turf King 0-0-7 Fertilizer with Imi-Lambda T&) Insecticide (SGN 220) 50 Ib. bag 100 NO BID NO BID $22.50 $2,250.00
Nature Safe 10-2-8 w/ PBS 150 Fertilizer (SGN 230) 50 Ib. bag 8 NO BID NO BID $66.00 $528.00
Nature Safe 8-3-5 w/ AQM Fertilizer (SGN 140) 50 Ib. bag 14 NO BID NO BID $58.00 $812.00
The Andersons Contec DG 18-9-18 Fertilizer 40 Ib. bag 40 NO BID $68.50 $2,740.00 $68.80 $2,752.00
Primo Maxx Growth Plant Growth Regulator 1 gallon 1 $317.00 $317.00 $317.00 $317.00 $317.00 $317.00
Ascernity Fungicide 1gallon 2 $497.00 $994.00 $497.00 $994.00 $497.00 $994.00
Daconil Action Fungicide 2.5 gallon 1 $265.00 $265.00 $265.00 $265.00 $265.00 $265.00
Daconil Weatherstick Fungicide 2.5 gallon 2 $210.00 $420.00 Alternate see below $210.00 $420.00
Chlorothalonil 720 Fungicide 2 x 2.5-gal case 6 NO BID Alternate see below $155.00 $930.00
Ethephon 2SL Herbicide 2 x 2.5-gal case 2 NO BID $155.10 $310.20 $186.00 $372.00
Strobe 50WG Fungicide 2x 2.5-gal case 4 NO BID Alternate see below *$155.00 $620.00 *for 1 Ib. not 2.5-gal.
1-Pro 2 Fungicide 2 x 2.5-gal case 1 $465.90 $465.90 Alternate see below $325.00 $325.00
Imidacloprid 2F Insecticide 4x1 gal case 1 NO BID Alternate see below $220.00 $220.00
Strider 14.3% Fungicide 2 x 2.5-gal case 6 NO BID Alternate see below $355.00 $2,130.00
Anuew Plant Growth Regulator 1.5 Ib. container 3 $118.20 $354.60 $118.20 $354.60 $118.20 $354.60
Ruby Fungicide 0.49 Ib. container 2 NO BID Alternate see below $85.00 $170.00
Tartan Stressgard Fungicide 2.5 gallon container 1 $1,033.00 $1,033.00 $1,033.00 $1,033.00 $1,033.00 $1,033.00
Tyler Bent Special 28-8-18 Fe Water-Soluble Fertilizer 25 Ib. bag 8 NO BID NO BID $40.00 $320.00
Plant Food Company DKP XTRS 2-20-22 Liquid Fertilizer 2 x 2.5-gal case 8 NO BID NO BID $256.25 $2,050.00




Plant Food Company FloThru A-Plus Penetrant & Bio carbonate Reducer 2 x 2.5-gal case 1 NO BID NO BID $244.25 $244.25
Plant Food Company Sugar Cal 10% Calcium Chelate Sorbitol Chelated Calcium 2 % 2.5-qal case 3

Acetate 0 NO BID NO BID $196.25 $588.75
Plant Food Company Adams Earth Bio stimulate 2 x 2.5-gal case 2 NO BID NO BID $308.25 $616.50
Plant Food Company Green-T Micro Pack EDTA Chelate Solution 2 x 2.5-gal case 1 NO BID NO BID $281.75 $281.75
Plant Food Company Super MK Green 18-3-4 Liquid Fertilizer 2 x 2.5-gal case 2 Alternate see below NO BID $150.75 $301.50
Plant Food Hydration A-Plus, Plant and Soil Hydrating Agent 2 x 2.5-gal case 2 Alternate see below NO BID $449.50 $899.00
Turf King Tri-Rye Seed Blend 50 Ib. bag 4 NO BID Alternate see below $89.00 $356.00
Turf King Low Mow Bluegrass Seed Blend 50 Ib. bag 2 NO BID NO BID $163.50 $327.00
Chinook Creeping Bentgrass Seed 25 Ib. bag 4 NO BID NO BID $265.00 $1,060.00
Dithiopyr 2EW Herbicide 4 x1gal. case 0.25 NO BID $1,010.00 $252.50 $888.00 $222.00
Roundup Pro Max Herbicide 1.67 gal container 2 NO BID $95.69 $191.38 $90.00 $180.00
Enclave Fungicide 2 x 2.5-gal case 1 $610.00 $610.00 $610.00 $610.00 $610.00 $610.00
Bifenthrin Golf and Nursey Insecticide 4 x 1 gal. case 0.25 NO BID $180.96 $45.24 $195.00 $48.75
Turf Marker Blue 4x1gal. case 1 NO BID Alternate see below $300.00 $300.00
Alternates

Harrell's MAX 18-3-6 with UMAXX 2 x 2.5-gal case 2 $126.40 $252.80 NO BID $0.00
Harrell's Hydro-90 2 x 2.5-gal case 2 $388.00 $776.00 NO BID $0.00
Sustane Organic-Base Fertilizer 50 Ib. bag 91 $55.40 $5,041.40 $0.00
Lebanon Proscape 25-0-5 50 Ib. bag 74 $31.54 $2,333.96 $0.00
Lesco Manicure Ultra 5Lb. 2 $38.18 $76.36 $0.00
Lesco Manicure 6FI 2 x 2.5-gal case 6 $140.18 $841.08 $0.00
Quali-Pro Strobe 50WG Tip & Pour 1 Ib. 6x11b. case 4 $551.16 $2,204.64 $0.00
Lesco 18 Plus 2 x 2.5-gal case 1 $342.40 $342.40 $0.00
Lesco Bradnt 2F 4 x 1 gal. case 1 $195.68 $195.68 $0.00
Lesco Spectator Ultra 14.3% 2 x 2.5-gal case 6 $316.14 $1,896.84 $0.00
Emerald 70EG 0.49 Ib. bag AGENCY 0.49 Ib. container 2 $123.97 $247.94 $0.00
Lesco Double Eagle 50 Ib. bag 4 $84.59 $338.36 $0.00
Lesco Tracker Spray Dye Blue 2 x 2.5-gal case 1 $174.68 $174.68 $0.00
Totals $10,318.30 $20,806.26 $55,107.50
Addendum Acknowledgement (if any) N/A N/A N/A
Bid Bond or Check (B / C) N/A N/A N/A
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Y Y Y
Certificate of Compliance with the Iran Divestment Act Y Y Y
Sexual Harassment Form Y Y Y
SAM's & NYS Debarred N N N




